
Hans Daniels is a seasoned leader with extensive experience
in the chemical industry and a proven track record of
managing complex operations. Currently, he serves as
General Manager at Sun Ace Gulf Co and at Industrial
Additives Manufacturing Company LLC (INDADD), both
based in Jubail Industrial City, Saudi Arabia. Prior to these
roles, Hans was the General Manager of Operations UAE at
Lepidico Ltd, where he played a pivotal role in permitting,
design, and advancing the company towards its Final
Investment Decision (FID), significantly contributing to its
operational excellence. 

Before joining Lepidico, Hans held several leadership
positions during his tenure at SONGWON Industrial Group.
He began his career at SONGWON in 2013 as the driving
force behind the construction and startup of the state-of-
theart manufacturing plant in Abu Dhabi dedicated to One
Pack Systems (OPS).
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Hans later went on to become General Manager of
SONGWON Polysys Additives LLC in the Khalifa Industrial
Zone Abu Dhabi (KIZAD) and Global Leader Physical
Products for SONGWON Industrial Group. During this time,
he successfully managed operations in the Middle East and
oversaw the operations of SONGWON’s OPS manufacturing
plants worldwide, strengthening the company’s global
presence and reputation. Earlier in his career, Hans gained
invaluable expertise in production, logistics, and
management through his roles at Fluor, one of the world's
leading engineering, procurement, and construction firms,
and Cabot, a global leader in specialty chemicals and
performance materials. 

Hans holds a Bachelor of Science (B.Sc.) in Chemical
Engineering from The Hague University of Applied Sciences,
and throughout his career, he has demonstrated a strong
commitment to innovation, operational efficiency, and
leadership in the chemical and industrial manufacturing
sectors.


